

2022 Alcona County Road Commission Material Bid Tab (2-21-2022)

1-CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS

Business:	15" (Gauge; per foot)	18" (Gauge; per foot)	24" (Gauge; per foot)	30" (Gauge; per foot)	36" (Gauge; per foot)	48" (Gauge; per foot)
St. Regis Culvert, Inc.	16 - \$13.20	16 - \$16.50	16 - \$20.90	14 - \$34.50	14 - \$42.15	14 - \$57.60
Jensen Bridge and Supply Co.	16 - \$13.05	16 - \$15.90	16 - \$21.15	14 - \$33.45	14 - \$40.50	12 - \$73.00
Cadillac Culvert, Inc	16 - \$13.95	16 - \$16.75	16 - \$22.15	14 - \$34.25	14 - \$42.25	12 - \$75.40

2-CRUSHED AND WASHED LIMESTONE - Stockpiled

Business:	Location	29A (per ton)
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Lincoln	\$17.00
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Harrisville	\$17.30
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Greenbush	\$17.45
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Spruce	\$15.90
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Glennie	\$19.55
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Black River	\$16.35
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Hubbard Lk (N)	\$16.46
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Hubbard Lk (S)	\$16.90
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Curran	\$17.50
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Mikado	\$17.50
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Barton City	\$17.90
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Curtisville	\$19.90

3-CRUSHED AND WASHED LIMESTONE - Picked Up

Business:	Location	29A (per ton)
Specification Stone Products	1009 Long Lake Road Alpena, MI 49707	\$10.75

4-BLAST FURNACE SLAG

Business:	Location	BF Slag 29A Slag (per ton)
NO BIDS		

5-ASPHALT EMULSIONS

Business:	HFRS2 (per gal)	HFRS2M (per gal)	CRS-2M(per gal)	AE-90 (per gal)	Fog Seal (per gal)
Bit-Mat Products of MI	\$2.35	No Bid	\$2.28	\$2.35	\$1.59
Michigan Paving & Materials Co.	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.24	\$2.05	\$1.49
Asphalt Materials, Inc.	\$2.25	\$2.55	\$2.60	\$2.25	\$1.75

2022 Alcona County Road Commission Material Bid Tab (2-21-2022)

6-BITUMINOUS PATCHING MATERIAL				
				<i>Alternative Products</i>
Business:	CP-6 (per ton)	CP-7 (per ton)	QPR (per ton)	UPM Cold Mix (Per ton)
UNIQUE Paving Materials Corp.	-	-	-	\$109.83
Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.	-	-	\$99.00	
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	-	-	\$98.90	

7,8, & 9 -AGGREGATE

Business:	Location	Placed (Unit Price Per Ton) Limestone		Stockpiled (Unit Price Per Ton) Limestone		Pickup (Unit Price Per Ton) Limestone	
		23A	22A	23A	22A	23A	22A
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Lincoln	\$12.79	\$12.79	\$12.79	\$12.79		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Harrisville	\$13.09	\$13.09	\$13.09	\$13.09		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Greenbush	\$13.24	\$13.24	\$13.24	\$13.24		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Spruce	\$11.69	\$11.69	\$11.69	\$11.69		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Glennie	\$15.34	\$15.34	\$15.34	\$15.34		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Black River	\$12.14	\$12.14	\$12.14	\$12.14		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Hubbard Lk (N)	\$12.25	\$12.25	\$12.25	\$12.25		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Hubbard Lk (S)	\$12.69	\$12.69	\$12.69	\$12.69		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Curran	\$13.29	\$13.29	\$13.29	\$13.29		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Mikado	\$13.29	\$13.29	\$13.29	\$13.29		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Barton City	\$13.69	\$13.69	\$13.69	\$13.69		
Everett Goodrich Trucking, Inc	Curtisville	\$15.69	\$15.69	\$15.69	\$15.69		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Lincoln	\$12.15	\$12.15	12.15	12.15		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Harrisville	\$12.15	\$12.15	12.15	12.15		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Greenbush	\$12.40	\$12.40	12.40	12.40		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Spruce	\$11.00	\$11.00	11.00	11.00		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Glennie	\$14.15	\$14.15	14.15	14.15		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Black River	\$11.60	\$11.60	11.60	11.60		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Hubbard Lk (N)	\$11.45	\$11.45	11.45	11.45		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Hubbard Lk (S)	\$11.95	\$11.95	11.95	11.95		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Curran	\$12.05	\$12.05	12.05	12.05		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Mikado	\$12.40	\$12.40	12.40	12.40		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Barton City	\$12.80	\$12.80	12.80	12.80		
Wangler & Sons Trucking, Inc.	Curtisville	\$14.90	\$14.90	14.90	14.90		
Specification Stone Products	na	-	-	-	-	\$6.20	\$6.55
Elmers Crane & Dozer, Inc	na	-	-	-	-	\$6.05	\$6.20

2022 Alcona County Road Commission Material Bid Tab (2-21-2022)

10-CHLORIDE

Business:	Dust Control (38% sol; per gal)	
	Continous Spread	Intermittent Spread
Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales	\$0.709	\$0.729
D & J Bowen Dust Control LLC	\$0.290	\$0.370
Michigan Chloride Sales	no bid	no bid

11-PAVEMENT MARKING SERVICES

Business:	Waterborne Paint- 4" Centerline Painting (per foot)		
	Centerline Painting	Yellow Paint to Barriers	Edgeline Painting
Michigan Pavement Markings LLC	\$0.060	\$0.000	\$0.060
M & M Pavement Marking	\$0.058	n/a	\$0.054
PK Contracting	\$0.056	-	\$0.052

Business:	Regular Dry- 4" Centerline Painting (per foot)		
	Centerline Painting	Yellow Paint to Barriers	Edgeline Painting
Michigan Pavement Markings LLC	\$0.080	\$0.000	\$0.080

12-CHEMICAL BRUSH CONTROL

Business:	Chem Brush Control (per gallon)
The Dalton's Inc	\$1.29
Allen Chase Enterprises, Inc.	\$2.88